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Jobn.S. Carbaaeh,'wbb^abbut two' C>
weeks ago left-his home in lower
Ayr township,: ifpr a visit_to hie
daughters in.IlQl'lidaysburg, died in
that -place last Friday inorning-from
Bronchial prieumo'nia,.aged "?5 years.
; .The.hody was brought by AutoHo.
this place last Saturday forenoon
and-.at 2 Vckfck of .that day was
buried in the Union cemetery..

Thedeceased .was a-'eoh of Jataes
and Rebecca •Carbaugh who move(
from .A<JamB Gp'urily.'tQ tho Cove
when :John'was :ihreb yo.arsl.of age.
From .that.time, to tho date of his
death hb, resided in Ayr'townshii

.and. wag'highly; eitbomed?by every
one. The;foljowing members of his

.family 6urviyo.^,;rMr8. Albert and
Mrs; Howard'Seville, ofCito: Mrs.
David Thomas: Mrs. Walter Honn

.and John of Ilbllidaysburgj .Edward j
of Freeport, 111.; and Courtney of
BigCove 'Tannery: ; Tho following
brothers "and sister'a also- survive;

;.William.'of Big Cove Tannery; Aus-.
'.tin of Chamb6rsburg;-Mr8. Luther
Tritlo of .Bridgeport, Md.•"; Mrs.
vAlbert; .Gordon, .Morcorsburg; and
Mrs. George- 'Glenn ot Webster

;Mill8. . - ^ '


